secretary@wangarattarsl.org.au

From: Finance Finance <finance@cav.org.au>

Sent: Friday, 13 May 2022 02:04 PM

To: Ronald Sneddon; president@wangarattarsl.org.au

Cc: Secretary

Subject: FW: RSL Community Grants Program

Attachments: 2019-2020 RSL Community Grants Program APPLICATION FORM.pdf; Community

Grants Program GUIDELINES July 2019.pdf

Good afternoon Ron and Greg,

In January, you approached our organisation about the wonderful grant opportunity available through your Community
Grants Program. Due to unforeseen circumstances, we were unable to submit an application by the January closing
date however | wonder if we would still be in the position to apply.

Your consideration is greatly appreciated.

Kind regards,

c E N T R E Annette Atteridge
Finance Manager

Ph: 03 5722 2203

AGAINS1 M: 0419 585 418

“Centre Against Violence acknowledges the traditional custodians of this land on which we stand and pay our respects to
the elders, past, present and future, for they hold the memories, the traditions and the culture of all Aboriginal and Torres
Strait Islander people.

I acknowledge victim survivors of sexual harassment, assault and abuse, family violence and relational violence. |
acknowledge their resilience, strengthen and determination to not be defined by their experiences. | acknowledge those
who have lost their lives through sexual assault and family violence “

This communication is intended only to be read or used by the addressee. The information contained in this communication may be
confidential information. If you are not the intended recipient

From: secretary@wangarattarsl.org.au <secretary@wangarattarsl.org.au>
Sent: Tuesday, 18 January 2022 1:52 PM

To: Finance Finance <finance@cav.org.au>

Cc: Ronald Sneddon <ronald.sneddon@bigpond.com>

Subject: RE: RSL Community Grants Program

Hi Annette, copies attached as requested. If you have queries please give Ron or myself a call.



